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Key Verses and References 
 

Proverbs 3:1-6 
1 My son, forget not my law; but let your heart keep my 
commandments: 2 For length of days, and long life, and 
peace, shall they add to you. 3 Let not mercy and truth 
forsake you: bind them about your neck; write them on 
the table of your heart: 4 So shall you find favor and good 
understanding in the sight of God and man. 5 Trust in the 
LORD with all your heart; and lean not to your own 
understanding. 6 In all your ways acknowledge him, and 
he shall direct your paths. 

 
Matthew 4:18-20 
18 And Jesus, walking by the sea of Galilee, saw two 
brothers, Simon called Peter, and Andrew his brother, 
casting a net into the sea: for they were fishers. 19 And he 
said to them, Follow me, and I will make you fishers of 
men. 20 And they straightway left their nets, and followed 
him. 
 
Exodus 5:2 
2 And Pharaoh said, Who is the LORD, that I should obey 
his voice to let Israel go? I know not the LORD, neither 
will I let Israel go. 

 
The Great Controversy-Ch. 2 How To Defeat 
Satan-Ellen White 
https://egwwritings.org/?ref=en_GC.39&para=132.160 
 
True Revival Pg. 25 Ellen G. White  
https://egwwritings.org/?ref=en_TR.39&para=11974.194 
 
 



 

 

1 Peter 2:7-9 
7 To you therefore which believe he is precious: but to 
them which be disobedient, the stone which the builders 
disallowed, the same is made the head of the corner, 8 
And a stone of stumbling, and a rock of offense, even to 
them which stumble at the word, being disobedient: 
whereunto also they were appointed. 9 But you are a 
chosen generation, a royal priesthood, an holy nation, a 
peculiar people; that you should show forth the praises of 
him who has called you out of darkness into his 
marvelous light; 

 
John 15:13 
13 Greater love has no man than this, that a man lay 
down his life for his friends. 

 
Faith & Works Pg. 38-Ellen G. White 
https://egwwritings.org/?ref=en_FW.38&para=31.152 
 
That I May Know Him Pg. 356-Ellen G. White 
https://egwwritings.org/?ref=en_TMK.356&para=126.23
45 
 
Romans 8:18 
18 For I reckon that the sufferings of this present time are 
not worthy to be compared with the glory which shall be 
revealed in us. 


