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Surely at some time in your life you have worked 

for wages. You may even know what it is to toil all 
day long in the hot sun, until every muscle and 
bone in your body aches with tiredness. And all the 
while you kept thinking about the wage your 
employer had promised to pay you. You knew you 
deserved every cent, and probably more. 
The point is this: what your employer paid you was 

not a gift, but a debt. A wage is something that is 
paid since you earned it. This simple observation 
unlocks one of the most profound truths of the 
Bible. God says He is not an employer; He pays no 
one wages: “There is a remnant according to the 
election of grace. And if by grace, then it is no 
longer of works; otherwise grace is no longer grace. 
But if it is of works, it is no longer grace; otherwise 
work is no longer work” (Rom. 11:5, 6). 
So we see that grace is just the opposite of works. 

Suppose that you do not work for your employer at 
all. He owes you not one cent. And suppose, that in 
addition to the fact that you have done nothing to 
deserve anything from him, you have actually 
wronged him, perhaps stolen from him. He could be 
angry with you if he chooses. But then suppose that 
he shows kindness to you by freely giving you a 
new Mercedes, in spite of all the evil you have done 
to him. Such a gift would be grace. 
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Now let us suppose we think of Christ as our 
employer. Does He award salvation and eternal life 
as wages to those who work hard to earn them? Or 
does He give salvation freely as grace to people 
who don’t deserve it at all? And if He does do that, 
how can He be fair if He doesn’t save everybody 
alike? 
And, further, if He does save people by grace 

alone, what is the point of anyone needing a 
change of heart? People asked that same question 
in Paul’s day, “Why not say, ‘Let us do evil, that 
good may come’?” (Rom. 3:8). These are some of 
the problems that we would like to find answers to. 
If good people can earn salvation, do they not 

have every right to be proud of themselves? And if 
nobody can earn it, why should anyone even want 
to be good? 
The “father” of all who have faith 
About 1900 B.C. the Lord called a man out of Ur of 

the Chaldees to become an example of salvation by 
grace. Paul calls Abraham “the father of all who 
have faith.” In other words, all who believe in Christ 
are Abraham’s spiritual “children.” When the apostle 
Paul “turned the world upside down” with his 
teaching, it was Abraham whom he put forward as 
proof of his gospel. Abraham’s experience in finding 
salvation is a perfect example of how we too may 
find it. Did he earn it? Or was he simply saved by 
the grace of God? 
Paul asks, “What shall we say, then, of Abraham, 

the father of our race? What was his experience? If 
he was put right with God by the things he did, he 
would have something to boast about—but not in 
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God’s sight. The Scripture says, ‘Abraham believed 
God, and because of his faith God accepted him as 
righteous.’ A person who works is paid his wages, 
but they are not regarded as a gift; they are 
something that he has earned. But the person who 
depends on his faith, not on his deeds, and who 
believes in the God who declares the guilty to be 
innocent, it is his faith that God takes into account 
in order to put him right with himself” (Rom. 4:1-5, 
GNB). 
“By the free gift of God’s grace all are put right with 

him through Christ Jesus, who sets them free” 
(Rom. 3:24, GNB). 
If God saved Abraham simply by his grace, 

because Abraham believed, then it follows that you 
and I are saved in exactly the same way. Shocking 
as it may seem to us who think our age is especially 
enlightened, the gospel was preached to Abraham 
just as it is preached to us today (see Gal. 3:8). 
God requires no more from us today than He 
required from Abraham. He has always had only 
one way of saving lost men—through the same kind 
of faith that Abraham exercised. 
This is still a new idea to mankind, nearly 4000 

years later! You don’t see “grace” in the business or 
political world today, unless somebody happens to 
have learned it from Jesus Christ. You don’t get 
anything for free, whether a house, a farm, or a car. 
Nobody even brings you food for free. You have to 
earn everything you put into your mouth. The world 
operates strictly on the principle of “works.” You get 
what you earn, and what you don’t work for you 
don’t get. 
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So completely are people given over to the idea of 
“works” that they naturally imagine that God 
operates on the same plan. They suppose they 
must do something in order to earn salvation from 
Him. They must give Him something. They treat 
God as though He were a business owner. You 
never feel ashamed of yourself when you go into a 
retailer to buy something. You have your money, 
you pay it, and take what you have bought and you 
walk out proud and happy. You may even feel you 
have done the business person a favor, for you 
know he has made at least some profit on what he 
sold you. 
But when someone gives you something freely as 

an act of grace, you don’t know how you ought to 
feel. He has done you a favor, and it makes you 
feel humble. In some way you sense a debt to him. 
It’s our nature to think that God keeps a store and 

“sells” salvation to those who will pay Him with their 
goodness. They like to bargain with Him, to feel like 
they have something they can give to God—their 
works, their sacrifice, their devotion. It makes them 
feel a little proud. They consider themselves 
somewhat on a level with Him; they give Him 
something, and they receive something from Him. 
If Abraham had “worked” for his salvation, he 

would have felt the same way. This is the feeling 
that Satan wanted Adam and Eve to have: “Ye shall 
be as gods,” he promised, or “as God” (see Gen. 
3:5). Oh, how the proud heart of man has ever 
wanted to feel that way! It either elevates us to the 
level of God Himself, or drags Him to our level. 
Either way we end up the Big Man. 
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But God pays no wages whatever. All He gives is 
by grace, a free gift. The reason is that there is 
really nothing we can do to earn salvation, anymore 
than a baby can earn the food his parents provide 
him. They feed their baby “by grace.” They love 
him, that is all. And that is the reason God saves 
us. “It is by grace you are saved, . . . it is not your 
own doing. It is God's gift, not a reward for work 
done. There is nothing for anyone to boast of” (Eph. 
2:8, 9 NEB). 
One would think that all the world would receive 

this news with joy. But most people reject it. Why? 
They are too proud to come to God humbly and to 
hold out both hands in faith to receive from Him. To 
receive the “grace of God,” we must humble our 
hearts, and acknowledge that we are nothing, that 
we have nothing, and that we deserve nothing, and 
that He gives everything. 
Jesus says, “Look at the birds of the air; they do 

not sow and reap and store in barns, yet your 
heavenly Father feeds them” (Matt. 6:26 NEB). 
They live by the grace of God, yet people mock the 
idea of grace, saying, “That’s for the birds!” 
Does the Lord hold a court session every day to 

find out which of the birds deserve His grace? Does 
He ask each one, “Have you been a good bird 
today? If so, I’ll feed you; if not, I won’t”? 
God does not inquire if a person has been good 

before He gives her grace. Jesus said, “Your Father 
which is in heaven . . . makes His sun rise on the 
evil and on the good, and sends rain on the just and 
on the unjust” (Matt. 5:45). That is grace! All of us 
receive it. A thoughtful writer has said, “In the 
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matchless gift of His son, God has encircled the 
whole world with an atmosphere of grace, as real 
as the air which circulates around the globe.”1 
If the Lord has surrounded us with grace as 

abundant as the air we breathe, surely there is 
enough for us all! He says, “My grace is sufficient 
for you” (2 Cor. 12:9). Can you imagine a little 
mouse in the corn silo fearing it might die of 
famine? The owner could say, “Cheer up, little 
mouse; my corn is sufficient for you.” Or can you 
imagine a man standing on a mountain height afraid 
to fill his lungs with the wonderful air for fear there 
won’t be enough? The mountain would say, 
“Breathe your fill, man; my air is sufficient for you!” 
There are many people living in this world who in 

their hearts want to be right with God. But they have 
been taught to believe an idea that separates them 
from God. They have been taught to believe that 
God loves only good people, and that He restricts 
His grace to those who think they find it easy to 
obey Him. But many know that they have an evil 
heart that loves to do wrong; so they imagine that 
God is angry with them, or has turned away from 
them. 
But if the sunshine and the rain fall alike on the evil 

and the good, surely anyone can see that God’s 
grace comes likewise to every man, woman, and 
child on the earth. Have you done bad things? Do 
you feel yourself unworthy of the kindness of God? 
You are the very person to whom He gives His 
wonderful grace! 

                                                 
1 Ellen G. White, Steps to Christ, p. 68. 
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There is nothing you can do to earn it any more 
than you can earn sunshine or rain. You simply 
receive it with thankfulness. And this thankful 
receiving is what the Bible calls “faith.” If a person 
refuses to receive it or is not thankful for it, then he 
is guilty of the sin of “unbelief,” which is, literally, 
“non-faith,” or more pointedly, active disbelief. 
The New Testament is full of the story of God’s 

grace, mentioning it 150 times. To think that God 
loves bad people and blesses undeserving 
sinners—this was an idea that “turned the world 
upside down” in the days of the apostles (see Acts 
17:6). They showed how men have lived in rebellion 
and hatred of God (Rom. 5:10), twisted and 
perverted God’s truth (Rom. 1:18, 21), worshipped 
beasts and idols (vss. 18, 25), defiled the image of 
God in their own bodies by sexual sin (vss. 24-17), 
blasphemed the holy name of God (Rom. 2:24), 
even despised Him for His patience and kindness 
(vs. 4), and went so far as to slay His Son on a 
cross. Yet God gives them His grace, and calls 
them to repentance. He does not wait for the lost 
sinners to go in search of Him for He knows they 
could never find Him. So He goes in search of 
them. That is grace. 
We are “called. . . by His grace” (Gal. 1:15). We 

have “believed through His grace—it enables us to 
believe (Acts 18:27). We are justified by His grace 
(Titus 3:7). We are saved by His grace (Eph. 2:5, 
8). We know that we are sons of God, members of 
the royal family, because we stand in grace (Rom. 
5:2). And having begun to believe, we “grow in 
grace” (2 Pet. 3:18). 
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How has this gift come to us? “You know the grace 
of our Lord Jesus Christ, that though He was rich, 
yet for your sakes He became poor, that you 
through His poverty might become rich” (2 Cor. 
8:9). Ask any rich man what frightens him the most, 
and he will tell you it is his fear of becoming poor. 
But Jesus voluntarily chose to become poor for our 
sakes. That is grace. 
True religion is easily contrasted with false 
religion 
To appreciate this grace of God revealed in Christ 

is true religion. But there also is a false religion that 
has deceived almost the whole world. It could even 
bear the label of “Christian.” It teaches that men are 
naturally good, that they can save themselves, or at 
least help a lot towards that end. It is the kind of 
religion that includes the idea of bargaining with 
God, that puts man on a level with God. Whether it 
professes to be Christian or not, this kind of religion 
has its roots intertwined with heathenism because it 
is salvation by works. 
Both of these religions, the true one and the 

counterfeit, had their beginning in the Garden of 
Eden. When our first parents sinned, they lost their 
beautiful clothing of holiness that had covered 
them. For the first time they felt naked, and of 
course were ashamed. They immediately thought 
they could do something about it themselves—here 
is the beginning of the religion of salvation by 
works. They “sewed fig leaves together, and made 
themselves coverings” (Gen. 3:7). This was the first 
attempt ever made to atone for sin by man’s own 
works of righteousness! All our attempts to keep 
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God’s law by our own works of righteousness are 
just like those “coverings” of fig leaves. “We are all 
a unclean thing,” and “all our righteousnesses are 
like filthy rags” (Isa. 64:6). 
Could God accept those fig leaves? No, He must 

Himself clothe the nakedness of poor Adam and 
Eve. “As for Adam and his wife the Lord God made 
tunics [coats] of skin, and clothed them” (Gen. 
3:21). Have you ever wondered where the Lord 
found those skins? There was only one way. He 
had to slay an innocent animal, whose death 
pointed forward to the death of the great Lamb of 
God on His cross yet to come. And those garments 
were the work of God Himself, not man. Only He 
can clothe us! The garments are those of Christ’s 
righteousness, and they cost the blood of His Son. 
“Without shedding of blood there is no remission” 
(Heb. 9:22). 
Shall ye then “do evil, that good may come”? 
What is the purpose of this gift of God’s grace? Is 

it to excuse us to go on in a life of sin and 
selfishness? No; see what the grace of God does 
for us: 
“The grace of God has dawned upon the world 

with healing for all mankind; and by it we are 
disciplined to renounce godless ways and worldly 
desires, and to live a life of temperance, honesty, 
and godliness in the present age, looking forward to 
the happy fulfillment of our hopes when the 
splendor of our great God and Saviour Jesus Christ 
will appear. He it is who sacrificed Himself for us, to 
set us free from all wickedness and to make us 
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pure people marked out for His own, eager to do 
good” (Titus 2:11-14, NEB). 
This is the work that grace accomplishes in every 

heart that believes! “To set us free from all 
wickedness, and to make us pure . . .” The grace 
has “dawned” upon all alike, and the changed heart 
is the experience of those who “believe.” 
The grace of God never permits a person to 

transgress the holy law of God. Paul says, “Sin 
shall not have dominion over you, for you are not 
under the law but under grace” (Rom. 6:14). To be 
“under the law” means to be under the “dominion” 
of self, to be ruled by fear, and driven to evil 
thoughts and deeds. But that “dominion” is ended 
by the coming of grace. Now we are “under” a new 
“dominion”—an obligation imposed by deep 
heartfelt thankfulness for the grace of God revealed 
at the cross. 
“Shall we sin, because we are not under the law, 

but under grace? Certainly not!” (vs. 15). To be 
“under the law” is the same as being under “the 
curse of the law” (Gal. 3:10, 13). The “curse of the 
law” is the dominion of sin which is a life of habitual, 
captive disobedience to the law. A man may want to 
obey, but he finds he cannot, because he is a slave 
under the “dominion” of a life of habitual 
disobedience. “Christ has redeemed us from the 
curse of the law, having become a curse for us (for 
it is written, Cursed is every one who hangs on a 
tree” (vs. 13). What Christ has redeemed us from is 
disobedience to the law. This is made plain by 
verse 10: “Cursed is every one who does not 
continue in all things which are written in the book 



11 

of the law to do them.” There is never any “curse” 
on the one who obeys the law. Obedience always 
brings a blessing instead. 
Christ redeems us to a new life of true, happy 

obedience “under grace.” But Satan wants to make 
people think that “under grace” gives permission for 
living a life of sin. “I’m saved—glory, hallelujah—
now I can continue sinning!” What a lie! 
“God forbid,” says Paul: “Emancipated from sin, 

[you] have become slaves of righteousness. . . . As 
once you yielded your bodies to the service of 
impurity and lawlessness, so now you must yield 
them to the service of righteousness, making for a 
holy life” (Rom. 6:18, 19, NEB). 
Sin actually loses its “dominion” when grace is 

appreciated, for grace is the stronger master. It 
“emancipates” us more effectively than Abraham 
Lincoln’s Emancipation Proclamation freed the 
slaves. 
The Russian Czar, Alexander, used to love to 

disguise himself and mingle with his people to hear 
what they have to say. One night he visited the 
army camp and listened to some soldiers. While 
passing a tent he saw a young soldier sitting at a 
table with his head on his arm, sound asleep. The 
Czar tiptoed to the back of the chair and looked 
over his shoulder. There on the table before him he 
saw a loaded revolver. Beside the revolver was a 
sheet of paper with a long list of gambling debts. 
After seeing the total the Czar noted a sentence 

below the figures saying, “who can pay so much?” 
Suddenly the czar understood the situation. The 
young officer had gambled away all he had and was 
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about to take his own life for fear of not being able 
to meet his debts. 
Then the czar took up the pen and below the 

young soldiers question wrote the words “I, 
Alexander, Czar of Russia”. Quietly he turned away 
and went home. 
The next morning the young officer woke up and 

immediately took hold of the revolver when 
suddenly he saw writing on his letter that he had not 
put there. He read the words of the Czar and in 
amazement he dropped the revolver. At that 
moment a messenger came to his tent with a bag of 
money from the Czar. The young soldier’s debt was 
paid and his life was spared. 


